
The Philosopher’s  Stone

4.... The arbitrariness of the legal definitions of 
crimes and punishments they nowadays try to 
mask through international harmonization. How 
slow development is can be seen from the fact 
that Roman Law is still studied. Rational and 
unitary principles are lacking, being necessary 
bases of humane and expedient legal concepts. It 
is still not understood that historical traditions do 
not furnish any rational bases of legal norms. The 
judicial bureaucracy with its cult of fictions, its 
circumstantial and unwieldy apparatus, 
counteracts legal reforms. They use a pompous 
ceremonial trying to surround the judicial 
procedure with the halo of infallibility, although 
it is clearly recognized that no court is able to 
define “the truth”, but can only judge the legal 
case on circumstantial evidence that is often very 
unsatisfactory. Those who deny in principle that 
might is right still regard might as a condition of 
right. The necessity of violence in a nation shows 
the remoteness of the stage of culture. 
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